
Terms and Conditions 
Disclaimer 

By accessing this website, users of the website agree to the terms of use set out below 
(Terms of Use). 

ResiFund may amend the Terms of Use at its discretion and without notice. By continuing to 
use ResiFunds’ website, users accept the Terms of Use as they exist from time to time. The 
Terms of Use will not be affected by, and will take precedence over, any other terms or 
conditions on this website. 

Definition of ResiFund 

References to ResiFund on this website and any material contained within may be taken to 
mean either Australian Residential Property Fund (ARSN’s 630 168 884 & 630 168 320 ), its 
responsible entity, Open Corp Funds Management Ltd (ABN 38 154 921 730) & AFSL 
417371or its associated company, ResiFund Management (ABN 36 601 942 901). 

Website material not financial advice 

The publications provided on this website are for the information and reference of the 
website’s users and for no other purpose. The contents of this website are not intended to 
be comprehensive, and do not constitute, and are not intended to be relied upon as, 
personal financial advice. 

While ResiFund attempts to ensure that the content of this website remains up-to-date, 
ResiFund does not provide any assurances or warranties in this regard. Users of the website 
should seek their own legal or other professional advice before acting or relying on any of 
the content of this website. 

Any user who accesses this Website or its content from outside Australia does so at its own 
risk. 

ResiFund Intellectual Property 

ResiFund owns the copyright in this website and its content unless otherwise stated. 

A revokable, non-exclusive and non-transferable licence to users of the website is provide 
by ResiFund. Users are permitted access to print and use the content for non-commercial or 
personal uses only. No part of the content of this website may be copied, transmitted, 
modified or used for any purpose without ResiFund’s prior written approval (except to the 
extent permitted by law). 

Reproduction of the content of this website, or any part of it, on another website is 
prohibited. 

Cookies 



ResiFund uses cookies on this website. Cookies may be used to monitor the use of its 
website by website users and in doing so may identify individual users on its server. 
ResiFund may sometimes use cookies to collect and store personal information about 
website users. 

Third Party Posting 

 
Links may be hosted on this website to display content or information from other websites 
within frames on this website (Third Party Content). No warranty or endorsement is 
provided by ResiFund as to the accuracy, currency, or suitability of any Third Party Content, 
or its author or owner, for any purpose. 

Any link to ResiFunds’ website that is hosted on another parties website must: 

· identify the link’s content as being owned by ResiFund;  

· be able to be removed within 24 hours upon any written request from ResiFund to do so; 

and 

· not use the information in a way that is misleading or deceptive. 

Disclosure of Personal and Business Information 

The names, ages, background, working history and email addresses of ResiFund's directors 
and employees may be published on this website. ResiFund does not consent to this 
information being used inappropriately. Inappropriate use may constitute issuing unsolicited 
commercial electronic messages, cold-calling, spamming or contacting for any purpose that 
does not relate directly to the recipient’s role or function. 

Software Liability 

ResiFund does not guarantee that the access or use of this website, or files and programs 
contained within, will not expose users to viruses, malware or other harmful technology or 
material which could damage or infect users’ data, hardware, software or other 
equipment. Access and use of this website is done at the users own risk in this regard and 
users irrevocably release ResiFund from all applicable liability and responsibility.  

Content Liability 

No warranties or representations about this website or any of its content are made by 
ResiFund. ResiFund will not be responsible for any loss suffered as a result of the use of 
this website or any of the website’s content.  

ResiFund excludes any liability which may arise as a result of the use of this website or its 
content, to the maximum extent permitted by law. In the event that liability cannot be 
excluded, any liability incurred by ResiFund in relation to the use of this website or its 
content will be limited to the extent provided for by the Australian Consumer Law (Schedule 
2 of the Competition and Consumer Act 2010). To the maximum extent permitted by Law, 



ResiFund will not be liable to any person for indirect, incidental, special or consequential 
loss. 

Privacy 

ResiFunds’ privacy policy forms part of these terms and conditions and may be found on the 
website or otherwise by contacting ResiFund 

Governing Law 

These Terms of Use are governed by the laws of Victoria, Australia and, in the event that a 
dispute arises in relation to this website or the Terms of Use, Victorian courts will have non-
exclusive jurisdiction. 

 


